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phen Morris in Rumah Nyala berichtet sie: “Slight hostil­
ity in atmosphere” (51) und “The visit was not a success. 
He and Derek have a bad effect on one another” (54). 

Persönliches erfahren wir in den Tagebüchern jedoch 
kaum. Monica Freeman benutzt ihr Tagebuch selten, um 
ihre Gedanken festzuhalten, ihre Meinung zu reflektieren 
oder Erlebtes emotional zu verarbeiten. Es sind vor allem 
die Briefe an ihre Mutter, aus denen man etwas über die 
Persönlichkeit der Autorin erfährt. So wird z. B. gleich zu 
Beginn des Buches ihre Begeisterung für Borneo deutlich, 
die bis auf wenige Tiefpunkte über die vielen Monate im 
Feld erhalten bleibt. Am 15. Juni 1949 schreibt sie: “It is 
perfectly beautiful here – far more so than I had imag­
ined and it would take pages to describe it all to you. … 
I don’t think I have ever been so completely absolutely 
happy before. I feel I should like to live always here like 
this …” (7). Ebenso deutlich wird ihre Begeisterung für 
die Menschen auf Borneo: “I can’t imagine missing com­
pany of any white people here in Sarawak, for the Iban 
people themselves are admirable friends. Many of them 
are not unlike people I have known in England, and these, 
I feel I have known for years – not weeks” (67). Monica 
Freeman beweist des Weiteren, dass sie einen guten Hu­
mor besitzt und über eine große Bereitschaft verfügt, sich 
auf das Leben der Iban einzulassen. So berichtet sie etwa 
in einem weiteren Brief an ihre Mutter, wie sie im Rah­
men eines Rituals durchs Langhaus getanzt ist: “The men 
and women insisted on dressing me in the men’s fur cape, 
sword and feathered hat and clad thus, I danced the length 
and back, of the longhouse with a procession behind me 
of beating gongs and drums at every post where there was 
an offering I had to produce a piercing yell. According to 
all reports I carried out this dance extremely well” (32). 

Laura P. Appell-Warren hat mit der Zusammenstel­
lung des Buches aus sechs Tagebüchern, den chronolo­
gisch eingefügten Briefen und der umfangreichen Illust­
ration mit 141 Abbildungen – davon ungefähr die Hälfte 
Zeichnungen von Monica Freeman und die andere Hälfte 
Fotografien von Derek Freeman – eine sehr wertvolle Ar­
beit geleistet. Sie zeichnet damit nicht nur ein interessan­
tes Portrait einer herausragenden Ethnografin, die man an 
der Seite ihres berühmten Mannes nicht übersehen sollte, 
sondern macht auch die in den Tagebüchern enthaltenen 
wertvollen Informationen zur Kultur der Iban einer brei­
ten Leserschaft zugänglich. 

Mit der Editierung des Buches durch Laura P. Appell-
Warren schließt sich allerdings auch ein persönlicher 
Kreis, der abschließend kurz erwähnt werden soll. Frau 
Appell-Warren ist die Tochter von George N. Appell, dem 
Vorsitzenden des Borneo Research Councils und ehemali­
gem Studenten von Derek Freeman. Laura P. Appell-War­
ren kennt daher Monica Freeman seit ihrer Kindheit. Das 
Buch ist damit nicht nur ein “tribute to a young woman 
who had to be tough as nails, resilient, flexible, cheerful 
and adventurous” (xiii), sondern auch eine besondere Art 
der Hommage von Laura P. Appell-Warren und ihrem Va­
ter an die Frau seines geschätzten Kollegen und Mentors.

Michaela Haug

Banks, Marcus, and Jay Ruby (eds.): Made to Be 
Seen. Perspectives on the History of Visual Anthropology. 
Chicago: The University of Chicago Press, 2011. 419 pp. 
ISBN 978-0-226-03662-5. Price: $ 35.00

Against the common impulse to define disciplinary 
boundaries, Marcus Banks and Jay Ruby’s “Made to be 
Seen. Perspectives on the History of Visual Anthropol­
ogy” elegantly traces the history of the visual in anthro­
pology, and suggests a number of untraveled routes and 
potential experimentations. Rather than cataloguing de­
finitive works in ethnographic film, photography, and text, 
the editors provide a glimpse into what the discipline of 
visual anthropology could become: a cross-disciplinary 
field engaged in a wide range of visual and media-making 
practices, productive theoretical engagements and pro­
posals, experimentation in visual and media forms, and 
innovation with collaborative methodologies, ethics, ac­
tivism, and cultural rights.

The history of the visual in anthropology may begin 
with still photography being put to anthropological use in 
the late 19th century; or, following Ruby’s definition of 
ethnographic film as that which is produced by anthropol­
ogists with anthropological intent, may begin post World 
War II. The editors point out that an anthropological mod­
el of visual communication was not formally articulated 
until the 1970s, emphasizing the relative immaturity of 
the discipline and the need for ongoing interrogation and 
theorization of the role of the visual in anthropology. Ac­
cordingly, the contributors to the volume exceed Banks 
and Ruby’s challenge to trace genealogies of the visual 
in their respective fields of study; instead, as the editors 
write in their introduction, “The essays in this volume 
all point to the inescapable entanglement of the visual 
in all areas of life, from the spontaneous act of seeing to 
the deeply considered artifice of film and art. While the 
book was originally conceived as an exploration of the 
history of the visual in a variety of anthropological fields, 
our contributors have gone far beyond this brief, not only 
highlighting pas” (16).

This history of the visual in anthropology is necessar­
ily wide-ranging, and as the contributors to the volume 
show, has been shaped and reshaped by the ideological, 
intellectual, and technological contexts in which practi­
tioners, scholars, and ethnographic subjects have brought 
meaning to the visible. For example, in her contribution 
entitled “Skilled Visions,” Cristina Grasseni identifies a 
persistent “constructivist” attitude towards visual repre­
sentations and looks to ethnographers of science, such 
as Bruno Latour, to understand visual artifacts as man­
ifestations of socially constructed and context-specific 
knowledge rather than objective actualities. Her inter­
disciplinary approach to theorizing practices of vision is 
approached from another angle by Sandra Dudley, who, 
in “Material Visions,” shows how textiles and clothing 
have been represented in visual media and argues that this 
under-studied domain, entangled with issues of identity, 
consumption, and temporality, should be understood as 
visual media in their own right. Roxana Waterson, simi­
larly, details the history of engagements with vernacular 
architecture in anthropology, where built forms are seen 
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as expressions of cultural identity, social relations, cos­
mology, and power – visual media in their own right – 
and suggests that the future of this domain of study will 
benefit from collaborations between anthropologists and 
architects. 

The contributors are united in their identification of, 
and continued support for, cross-disciplinary collabora­
tion and experimentation. Arnd Schneider looks back at 
the parallel histories of anthropology and the disciplines 
of art, art criticism, and art history to mine both produc­
tive examples and failed experiments of disciplinary bor­
der crossings, and to chart a way forward for anthropolo­
gists as creative agents. Here, the work of Maya Deren, 
for example, highlights moments of artistic, methodologi­
cal, and technological synergy, just as Kathryn Ramey’s 
exploration of the interconnections between experimental 
films and “films made with anthropological intent” illus­
trates potential for contemporary anthropologists to incor­
porate new approaches into their media production prac­
tices. Elizabeth Edwards’ contribution on the history of 
photography in anthropological practice details historical 
and contemporary “entanglements” with cross-cultural 
interaction, agency, and power, and their visual evidences, 
much in the way that Brenda Farnell theorizes the body as 
a component of visual culture that necessarily crosses the 
boundaries of biological and social being, and which also 
accounts for the invisible forms of cultural knowledge that 
bring embodied meaning to that which can be seen and 
experienced with the senses.

Visual mediums in anthropology are also historicized, 
contextualized, and projected into the future. Matthew 
Durington and Jay Ruby challenge the singular equation 
of visual anthropology with ethnographic film, and argue 
against the perception of ethnographic film as useful only 
as a teaching aid or research tool. Rather, ethnographic 
film should be seen as a powerful tool for self-expres­
sion, and should embrace possibilities associated with 
new digital technologies, hypermedia, and the Internet to 
represent ethnographic knowledge in new forms. Sarah 
Pink furthers this provocation in her review of practices 
in digital visual anthropology, showing how these emer­
gent forms are both modeling and problematizing collab­
orative practices, ethical considerations associated with 
the circulation of ethnographic media, and issues of de­
contextualization, while experimenting with the potential 
of new technologies to bridge the enduring representa­
tional divide between textual and visual anthropology. 
Faye Ginsburg builds on these discussions with her chap­
ter “Native Intelligence. A Short History of Debates on 
Indigenous Media and Ethnographic Film.” From contro­
versies over the protection of Aboriginal cultural property 
in digital environments like Second Life, to celebrations 
of indigenous television and film productions – from the 
Aboriginal Peoples’ Television Network in Canada to the 
Camera d’Or at Cannes – she traces ongoing concerns 
in the field of indigenous media, including questions of 
cultural difference, control of cultural representation in 
digital form, the negotiation of the right to self-represen­
tation, and indigenous media practice as cultural and po­
litical activism. Ginsburg’s re-invocation of the dynamic 

she has called the “parallax effect” – where indigenous 
and nonindigenous productions are brought into dialogue 
to offer a fuller view of the complexities of culture and 
media representations – suggest that indigenous media 
are already shifting relations of power between anthro­
pologists and Aboriginal communities and within settler 
states. Ginsburg’s assessment of the negotiations of in­
digenous media-makers as both receivers and producers 
reinforces Stephen Putnam Hughes’ argument for greater 
attention in anthropology to media audiences and recep­
tion and to the study of media-related practices as the in­
vestigation of “how people actually argue, construct, and 
contest the media worlds in which they live and why they 
do or do not matter ” (311).

As Michael Herzfeld points out in his postscript, the 
contributors to the volume have not attempted to present 
an evolution of visual anthropology as a discipline, but in­
stead have chosen to highlight risks taken, paths untrav­
eled, and paths resumed. This presentation of the visual 
in anthropology, and the effect of this volume in general, 
is the creation of genuine opportunity for reflection on the 
goals of the discipline. Banks and Ruby’s book makes vis­
ible the dynamism, experimentation, and intellectual rig­
or associated with the cross-disciplinary exploration of 
the visual in anthropology. While the volume itself is still 
limited to primarily textual exposition (surely a hypertext 
version was imagined as well), it should be tremendous­
ly inspiring for anthropologists who identify as working 
within the discipline and for those outside who have tak­
en up visual media as a natural extension of ethnographic 
documentary practice. New forms, methods, collabora­
tions, and ethical frameworks await. 

Kate Hennessy

Barbier-Mueller, Jean Paul: The Kalasan Batak. In 
North Sumatra, an Unknown Group. Genève: Fondation 
culturelle Musée Barbier-Mueller, 2011. 235 pp. ISBN 
2-88104-048-9. Price: CHF 25.00 – French Ed.: Au nord 
de Sumatra. Un group inconnu. Les Kalasan Batak. Paris: 
Éditions Hazan, 2011. 235 pp. ISBN 978-2-7541-0617-7. 
Prix: € 20.00

More than thirty years ago Jean Paul Barbier-Muel­
ler started exploring the North Sumatran regions inhab­
ited by societies lumped together by foreigners as Ba­
tak, yet wearing their specific socionyms like Toba, Karo, 
Simalungun, Pakpak, and others. It has to be admitted that 
members of some of these societies have adopted – for 
which reason ever – the additional Batak like Toba Batak. 
Also more than thirty years ago Barbier-Mueller start­
ed writing on different aspects of “Batak” cultural ways, 
above all on the artistic expression in several of these 
North Sumatran societies, and this has been congruent 
with one of his professions, the ambitious art collector.

Now, after more than thirty years, Barbier-Mueller 
publishes a marvellously illustrated book, which – as in­
dicated in a kind of subtitle – presents to the reader the 
Kalasan, “an unknown group … in North Sumatra.” To an 
anthropologist this may sound illogical, since the Kalasan 
know about themselves; they are known to neighbouring 
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